
Information:
Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1086834
Vendor Name: Jerry Haggerty Chevrolet

Check Details:
Check Number: E0106564
Check Amount: $ 293.33
Check Date: 3/26/2025

Invoice Details:
Invoice Number: 13418
Invoice Date: 2/7/2025
PO Number: B0002192
Voucher Number: V0879225

Document Type: AP Invoice
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Tue, Mar 18, 2025 at 03:26 PM UTC

Accounts Payables <payables@haggertyautogroup.com>

[External] Re: Invoice Request

 <payables@haggertyautogroup.com>Accounts Payables

CC:

BCC:

 This email originated from outside of COD’s system. Do not click links, open attachments, or respond with sensitive CAUTION:
information unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

On Tue, Mar 18, 2025 at 10:12AM Maday, Kari <  > wrote: madayk2239@cod.edu

Good morning, 

  

I am requesting a copy of invoice 13418 for $293.33 to be email to  invoicing@cod.edu

  

Thank you, 

  

Kari Maday 

Accounts Payable Specialist 

 Cash Disbursements/Payroll Department

 College of DuPage

 425 Fawell Blvd l SRC 2132 l Glen Ellyn, IL 60137-6599

  phone 630-942-4294 l    madayk2239@cod.edu

  

 



  

 This E-mail, including attachments, is the property of HaggertyAutoGroup. The contents of this NOTICE:
E-mail are protected by the Federal Electronic Communications Privacy Act, 18 U.S.C. 2510-2521. The 
contents of this E-mail are confidential and contain the legally privileged communication of 
HaggertyAutoGroup. If you are not the intended recipient, any retention, dissemination, distribution or 
copying of this communication is strictly prohibited by Federal law. Please reply to the sender that you have 
received the E-mail message in error, and then delete the E-mail message. 
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